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Silver Fortune Formula Course Launches New Affiliate Program 
Program helps users maximize profits on every referred sale 

 
FAIRFAX, Calif. – Dream Manifesto LLC, a company that provides financial education in the 
areas of wealth and investing, has launched its new, powerfully effective affiliate program for its 
Silver Fortune Formula Course. 

The course provides a life-changing program that helps individuals actually capitalize on one of 
the most devastating economic periods in modern history with silver investing. Through this 
affiliate program, marketers can earn up to half of the profits made from each referral that ends 
up being a sale. 

“Our affiliate program is a great way to earn money by referring visitors to our website," said 
Thomas Herold, CEO of Dream Manifesto. “It’s as easy as using your personalized reference 
link to promote our site through your own. Each time someone buys directly from us through 
your link, you’ll bring in half of the profits. I challenge website owners and bloggers to find a 
better deal through any affiliate program.” 

Herold is well respected as a financial expert in today’s market. With decades of experience in 
trading and investing in precious metals, he has been highly successful in maintaining stability 
during the global economic recession. His book, "Building Wealth with Silver," was recently 
named one of the top 100 investment books on Amazon.com. 

Through the new affiliate program, the Silver Fortune Formula Course aims to partner with 
affiliate marketers to help spread the word about its services. Through these partnerships, 
Herold is able to split profits with current investors, giving them 50 percent off each referred 
sale. Members of the affiliate network will also have access to their own exclusive members 
site, where they can track their referrals and see their profits grow.  

“Our economic system has been in disarray for some time and it’s affecting more and more 
people every day,” Herold said. “It’s important for people to realize that there are still options out 
there that allow them to turn a profit. The best part about our referral program is that when 
you’re an affiliate, you’re not only making money, but you are also helping others find success." 

The Silver Fortune Formula Course was developed to educate individuals on the devaluation of 
paper money, which can bring the middle class into poverty. Precious metals, especially silver, 
preserve their purchase values, and the course shows how to invest in silver to increase one's 
wealth. At a time when the price of silver is down to $30, from a high of $48, there are 
tremendous opportunities for investments. 

For more information about the affiliate program or to join, visit 
http://www.wealthbuildingcourse.com/affiliate. The company can also be reached at 800-856-
9921 (toll free) or 1-415-233-7063 (international). 
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